
DON HINDS FORD, INC. 

Petitioner's Attachment 2-D 

65,900.75 

Trading Difference $65,900.75 

# of tires 5 $1.25 
8.00 

Total Balance Due 

12610 Ford Drive 
Fishers, IN 46038 

i.::::..:..:~"'-=_:__:_:__:_:.::....:..=..:::..::__:__:._:c,__.;_,-,,, 

Phone (317) 849-9000 x1290 
Toll Free (800} 644-4637 x1290 
Direct Phone & Fax 317-813-1319 



12/10/21, 9:27 AM 

S~les Pe!_son: ~a.~~r~m~~-r.ig_h~ 
Buyer Home Phone: 

Address: 5130 N State Rd 135 

Co-Buyer Address: 
- --' ~"::~. ·- . .-:~• .. ·-~:::..~'.: 

---r 

Petitioner's Attachment 2-E 
https:/lcrm. trailercentral .com/b ill-of-sale/print/sale/17914 

ill ale 
Mayes Trailer Sales, Inc. 

1101 US-31 New Whiteland IN, 46184 US 

PHONE#: 3175355901 

INVOICE #: Autolnv17914 

BUYER PERSONAL INFORMATION 

DL: 

DL: 

.?e!!very_ ?~te: 2021-12-:Q~. __ 

Buyer Work Phone: Buyer Cell Phone: 812-988-

6611 

Co-Buyer Phone: 

City~ ~tat_!~ ZIP: t-A~~gantown, IN, 46160 

Co-B_~Y,:~r, Co~~ty: 

~i~ T~: ?~30 ~tat~_Rd -~3~,M~!"_§a.~t_?~n, ~' 46160 

_ _!hysic~I ~~~r,:.~s: 5)3~.!'I St~t~. Rd_ 1~5, ~-~rgan,t~w~.'. IN, 4~160 

Retail Unit ITEMIZATION 

RETAIL PRICE: _Pay'!'ent TYP,! ~. ?~te , __ ~~l_d $8~60.02._ o_n 2~.~1 ~ 1~-10 ysi_n.g EHECK $8,960.00 
. ' ' -ll 

N/U/D: New Year: 2022 
.., .... - ....... ' .. 

Model: TBCT2014ET 

~~:~ E_g~ip,:n~nt__ . ,, 
VIN:4l5ST2528NF058412 

Stock Number 4LSST2528NF058412 

Manufacturer: 8-B 

W~ight: 366~ 

Plate No: 

Inventory Col~ black 

GVW: 14000.00 

TOTAL AFTER DISCOUNT: 

Totals 

PARTS TAX RATE: 

LABOR TAX RATE: 

SUBTOTAL: 

TOTAL TAX: 

TOTAL: 

PAYMENTS RECEIVED: 

CHANGE DUE: 

$8,960.00 

7.00% 

0.00% 

$8,960.00 

- !~-~o 
$8,960.00 -
$8,96~.o~ 

$0.00 

I hereby authorize the above repair work to be done along with the necessary material, and hereby grant you and/or your 

employees permission to operate the vehicle herein described for the purpose of testing and/or inspection. An express mechanic's lien is 

hereby acknowledged on this vehicle to secure the amount of repairs thereto. You will not be held responsible for loss or damage to the 

vehicle in case of fire, theft, or any other cause beyond your control. If it becomes necessary for you to employ a collection agent and/or 
attorney to collect this amount, I the undersigned agree to pay all court costs plus a reasonable attorney's fee and/or collection agency fee. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: A SERVICE CHARGE OF 2% per month, which is an ANNUAL PERCENTAGE RATE OF 24% will be made on accounts over 

thi~.P~) days :?I~. Buy~!s Tr~de-ins Free from any Mortgage or Lien. Used Trailers (Sold As Is). No Refund on deposits. 

SIGNATURES 

: Date: 
., •• ,.,-.· ;..i -

' Date: 

Date: 

https://crm .trailercentral.com/bil l-of-sale/print/sale/17914 1/2 



Petitioner's Attachment 2-F 

Connie Buterbaugh 

From: 
Sent: 

Justin Hawley <jhawley@browncountywater.com> 
Friday, November 12, 2021 8:56 AM 

To: Christy Schmidt 
Subject: Fwd: [EXTERNAL] Pricing 

Get Outlook for iOS 

From: Justin Hawley <jhawley@browncountywater.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 10, 2021 6:22:10 PM 
To: Jake Gay <Jake.Gay@vermeermidwest.com> 
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Pricing 

Thanks Jake! That's all I need right now. 

Appreciate it. 

Get Outlook for iOS 

From: Jake Gay <Jake.Gay@vermeermidwest.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 10, 2021 3:24:23 PM 
To: Justin Hawley <jhawley@browncountywater.com> 
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Pricing 

Hey Justin, 

So sorry for the delay on getting back to you. Right now as we sit pricing on a new LP573SDT is $84,000. If I can provide 
any further information, please let me know. 

Thanks, 
Jake Gay 

Vermeer Midwest 

t: +1 (317) 842-1040 I m: +l (317) 695-6943 
e: Jake.Gay@vermeermidwest.com I w: www.vermeermidwest.com 
a: 13402 Britton Park Rd., Fishers, IN 46038 

We appreciate your business! Click here to give us feedback. 

This electronic mail message is intended only for the use of the person or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain confidential or private information. 

\Distribution or copying by any person or entity other than the intended recipient is hereby prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify 

1 



Vermeer Midwest, 120 E. Martin Drive, Goodfield, Illinois 61742, of the error, delete the message and destroy any copy of the message. 

From: Justin Hawley <jhawley@browncountywater.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 10, 20211:32 PM 
To: Jake Gay <Jake.Gay@vermeermidwest.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Pricing 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open 
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

Jake, 

Brown County Water Utility is wanting to get pricing on a new LP 573 vac. More or less just curious at the moment. 

If this is not your area could you recommend someone I could email with. 

Appreciate the help. 

Thanks, 

Justin Hawley 
Brown County Water Utility, Inc. 
General Manager 
5130 N State Road 135 
Morgantown, IN 46160 
812-988-6611 Office 
812-988-9351 Fax 
ihawley@browncountywater.com 
www.BrownCountyWater.com 

Oamlitv 
~On'Hi'p! 

~ 
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